
WORKSHOPS (Session2020-21) 

MANPREET KAUR 

 

S No. Name of Training Courses Duration / No. of 

days 

Organized by 

 

1. Pre Vocational Education 2hr CBSE 

2. KVS_Health and Well-being in 
schools. 

1hr CBSE 

3. CBSE_Pedagogy of Social 
Sciences 

1 hr CBSE 

4. Initiative in school education 1 hr CBSE 

5. Competency_based education 
Module-1 

1hr CBSE 

6. Competency_based education 
Module-2 

1hr CBSE 

7. Competency_based education 
Module-3 

1hr CBSE 

8. Competency_based education 
Module-4 

1hr CBSE 

9. Health and well being in school 3 hr CBSE 

10. CBSE_Preschool Education 1.5 hr CBSE 

11. CBSE_Pedagogy of Science 1.5 hr CBSE 

12. KVS_Developing Personal-
Social Qualities for creating a 

safe and healthy school 
environment 

2 hr CBSE 

13. Experiential learning course 1.5 hr CBSE 

14. KVS_Curriculum and inclusive 
classrooms 

2 hr CBSE 

15. CBSE_Pedagogy of languages 3 hr CBSE 



16. Pedagogy of environmental 
studies 

3 hr CBSE 

17. CBSE Art Integrated learning 2 hr CBSE 

18. Understanding rights, Child 
Abuse and The POCSO Act, 

2012 

1 hr CBSE 

19. School based assessment 1 hr CBSE 

20. Implementation of art 
integration learning in English 

language teaching 

1.30 hr Goyal Brothers 
PRAKASHAN 

21. Pedagogy of Mathematics 2 hr CBSE 

22. Integrated gender in teaching 
learning process 

3 hr CBSE 

23. Pedagogy of languages 3 hr CBSE 

24. Covid-19 Scenario :Addressing 
Challenges in School Education 

3 hr CBSE 

25. Integration of ICT in teaching 
learning and assessment 

1 hr CBSE 

26. Stress Management during 
Covid-19 Pandemic 

2 hr Goyal Brothers 
PARKASHAN 

27. Literature in classroom English 
(Poetry, prose,story,drama, 

novel) 

1 hr CBSE 

28. Competency building for Pre 
Primary teachers (Multiple 
intelligence and phonics) 

1.30 hr Full Marks 



29. As-Art Integrated Learning 2 hr CBSE 

30. Assesment from home 1 hr RatnaSagar 

31. New Education Policy(2020) 
Early childhood care 

1 hr RatnaSagar 

32. How to conduct online Classes 
using simple tools 

2 hr Ratna Sagar 

33. National education policy and 
its implications in school 

2 hr Oxford 
university 

34. Art-Integrated Learning(AIL) in 
Mathematics 

1 hr Bright Tutee 

35. Webinar on Early childhood 
education in today’s scenario 

1 hr Goyal brothers 
PARKASHAN 

36. Art integration learning in 
Social science 

1.30 hr Bright tutee 

37. Developing social Personal 
qualities and creating safe and 
healthy School environment 

2 hr CBSE 
 

38. ������ �� ������ 
���� 

1hr SPBooks 

39. Pee -Primary Webinar 1 hr CBSE 
40. Webinar on brain power 

program 
1 hr CBSE 

41. CBSE School 
leadership:Concept and 

Application 

1 hr CBSE 

 



WORKSHOPS (2020-21) 

SANDEEP KAUR 

S.no. Name of training courses Duration/no.of days Organised by 

1. School based assessment 1 hr CBSE 

2. Pedagogy of social sciences 1 hr CBSE 

3. As art integarated learning 1 hr Nishtha 

4. Competency based education 
module 1 

1 hr CBSE 

5. Competency based education 
module 2 

1 hr CBSE 

6. Competency based education 
module 3 

1 hr CBSE 

7. Competency based education 
module 4 

1 hr CBSE 

8. Pedagogy of mathematics 1 hr CBSE 

9. Pedagogy of environmental 
studies 

1 hr CBSE 

10. Pre school education 

 

1 hr CBSE 

11. Pedagogy of science 

 

1 hr CBSE 

12. Experiential learning course 

 

1 hr CBSE 



13. Integrating gender in the 
teaching learning process 

1 hr CBSE 

14. Initiatives in school education 1 hr CBSE 

15. Pedagogy of languages 1 hr CBSE 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



WORKSHOPS (2020-21) 

SANDEEP KAUR NEW 

Sr .no Name of Training Course Duration / No . 

Of Days 

Organized 

by 

1 Implementation of art integrated 

learning inEnglish language 

teaching. 

2 hrs Goyal Brothers 

Prakashan 

2 Stress Management during 

Covid -19 pandemic. 

2 hrs Goyal Brother 

Prakashan 

3 Multiple intelligences and 

phonics. 

1 hr Zoom 

By - Pvt.ltd.delhi. 

4 Pedagogy of social sciences. 1 hr CBSE 

5 Pedagogy of Science. 1 hr CBSE 

6 Pedagogy of Languages. 1 hr CBSE 

7 AS_ Art Integrated Learning. 1 hr NISHTHA 

8 COVID -19 Scenario : 

Addressing challenges in school 

Education. 

1 hr CBSE 

9 ������ �� ������ 

���� 

2 hr S.P BOOKS 

10 Experiential learning course. 1 hr CBSE 

11 Competency based education 

Module - 1. 

1 hr CBSE 

12 Competency based education 

Module - 2. 

1 hr CBSE 

13 Competency based education 

Module - 3 

1 hr CBSE 

14 Competency based education 

Module - 4 

1 hr CBSE 

15 Discussion on early childhood 

education in present primary 

teacher 

2 hrs Goyal brothers 

prakashan 

16 Pedagogy of environmental 

studies 

1 hr CBSE 

17 School Based Assesment 1 hr CBSE 

18 Pre - vocational Education 1 hr CBSE 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

19 Curriculum and inclusive 

classroom 

1 hr KVS 

20 Health and well being in school 1 hr KVS 

21 Developing personal social 

qualities for creating a safe and 

healthy school environment 

1 hr KVS 



WORKSHOPS (2020-21) 

RAMINDER KAUR 

 

S. NO Name of Training Courses Duration / 

No. of days 

Organised 

By 

1 How to conduct online 

Classes using simple tools. 

2 hrs Goyal Brothers 

Prakashan . 

2 Discussion on Early childhood 

Education in Today's scenario. 

2 hrs Goyal Brothers 

Prakashan. 

3 Implementation of Art integrated 

learning in English language teaching 

. 

2 hrs Goyal Brother 

Prakashan. 

4 Health and well - being in school. 1 hr KVS 

5 Developing personal - social qualities 

For creating a safe & healthy school 

environment. 

1 hr KVS 

6 Curriculum and Inclusive classrooms. 1 hr KVS 

7 Experiential learning course. 2 days. CBSE 

8 Pedagogy of social sciences. 1 hr CBSE 

9 Pedagogy of science. 1 hr CBSE 

10 AS_ Art integrated learning. 1 hr NISHTHA 

11 Preschool education. 1 hr CBSE 

12 COVID -19 scenario : 

Addressing challenges in school 

education. 

1 hr CBSE 

13 Understanding Rights , Child sexual 

Abuse & 

The POCO Act , 2012. 

1 hr CBSE 

14 Integrating Gender in the teaching 

Learning process. 

1 hr CBSE 

15 Intitatives gender in the teaching 

learning 

Process. 

1 hr CBSE 

16 Pariksha pe charcha. 1 hr CBSE 

17 Experiential learning course. 1 hr CBSE 

18 Competency based education 

Module - 1. 

1 hr CBSE 

19 Competency based education 1 hr CBSE 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Module - 2. 

20 Competency based education 

Module -3. 

1 hr CBSE 

21 Competency based education 

Module - 4. 

1 hr CBSE 

23 Initiatives in school education . 1 hr CBSE 



WORKSHOPS (2020-21) 

RAJDEEP KAUR 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Sr .no Name of Training Course Duration / No . 

Of Days 

Organized 

by 

1 Implementation of art integrated 

learning inEnglish language 

teaching. 

2 hrs Goyal Brothers 

Prakashan 

2 Stress Management during 

Covid -19 pandemic. 

2 hrs Goyal Brother 

Prakashan 

3 Multiple intelligences and phonics. 1 hr Zoom 

By - Pvt.ltd.delhi. 

4 Pedagogy of social sciences. 1 hr CBSE 

5 Pedagogy of Science. 1 hr CBSE 

6 Pedagogy of Languages. 1 hr CBSE 

7 AS_ Art Integrated Learning. 1 hr NISHTHA 

8 Pre-school Education 1 hr CBSE 

9 COVID -19 Scenario : 

Addressing challenges in school 

Education. 

1 hr CBSE 

10 Understanding Rights, Child 

sexual Abuse and The POCO Act , 

2012. 

1 hr CBSE 

11 Integrated Gender in the teaching 

Learning process . 

1 hr CBSE 

12 Initiatives in school Education. 1 hr CBSE 

13 Pariksha Pe Charcha 2021. 1 hr CBSE 

14 Experiential learning course. 1 hr CBSE 

15 Competency based education 

Module - 1. 

1 hr CBSE 

16 Competency based education 

Module - 2. 

1 hr CBSE 

17 Competency based education 

Module - 3 

1 hr CBSE 

18 Competency based education 

Module - 4 

1 hr CBSE 

 

 



WORKSHOPS (2020-21) 

NAVDEEP KAUR 

Sr.no. Name of Training Course Duration / No . 

Of Days 

Organized 

by 

1 Discussion on early childhood 

education in pre primary teachers 

2 hrs Goyal brothers 

Prakshan 

2 Implementation of art integrated 

learning inEnglish language 

teaching. 

2 hrs Goyal Brothers 

Prakashan 

3 Stress Management during 

Covid -19 pandemic. 

2 hrs Goyal Brother 

Prakashan 

4 Pedagogy of social studies 

 

2  hr CBSE 

5 Pedagogy of Science. 

 

1 hr CBSE 

6 Pedagogy of Languages. 

 

1 hr CBSE 

7 Pre-vocational  Education 1 hr CBSE 

8 COVID -19 Scenario : 

Addressing challenges in school 

Education. 

1 hr CBSE 

9 Understanding Rights, Child sexual 

Abuse and The POCO Act , 2012. 

1 hr CBSE 

10 Initiatives in school Education. 1 hr CBSE 

 

10 Initiatives in school Education. 1 hr CBSE 

11 Experiential learning course. 1.20 mins CBSE 

12 Competency based education 

Module - 1. 

1 hr CBSE 

13 Competency based education 

Module - 2. 

1.30 mins CBSE 

14 Competency based education 

Module - 3 

1 hr CBSE 

15 Competency based education 

Module - 4 

1 hr CBSE 

16 School leadership : concepts and 

applications 

1 hr CBSE 

17 As Art integrates learning 2 hr KVS 



 

18 Pedagogy of Environmental Studies 

 

1 hr CBSE 

19 School Based Assessment 

 

1 hr CBSE 

20 Pre school education 

 

2 hr CBSE 

21 Competency building for Pre 

primary Teacher 

(intelligence $ phonic) 

 

3 hr Zoom by _full 

mark's Put.Ltd. 

(Delhi) 

22 Intergrating  Gender in the teaching 

learning process 

1 hr CBSE 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



WORKSHOPS  (2020-21) 

MEENA SHARMA 

 

Sr 

no. 

Name of Training course Duration/no.of 

days 

Organized by 

1 pedagogy of environmental studies 1 hrs CBSE 

2 Pedagogy of mathematics 1 hrs CBSE 

3 pedagogy of science 1 hrs CBSE 

4 Pedagogy of social sciences 1 hrs CBSE 

5 Pedagogy of languages 1 Hrs CBSE 

6 School based Assessment 1 hrs CBSE 

7 Understanding &implimentition  of art 

integrated learning in hindi language 

2 hrs Goyal 

brothers 

Prakshan 

8 Experiential learning course 2days CBSE 

9 Curriculum and Inclusive classrooms 1 hrs KVS 

10 Competency based Evaluation module 

4 

1 hrs CBSE 

11 Competency based Education module 

1 

1 hrs CBSE 

12 School leader ship :concepts & 

applications 

1 hrs CBSE 

13 Competency based education module 

2 

1 hrs CBSE 

14 Competency based education module 

3 

1 hrs CBSE 

15 Pre -vocational education 

 

1 hrs CBSE 

16 Understanding rights,child sexual 

abuse &The POCSO Act 2012 

1 hrs CBSE 

17 Basics of Covid 19 

 

1 hrs CBSC 

18 As Art integrated learning 

 

1 hrs CBSE 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

19 Understanding & implementation of 

competency based education in hindi 

2 hrs Goyal 

prakshan 

20 �वघालय आधा
रत आकलन 1 hrs CBSC 

21 Integrating gender in the teaching 

learning process 

1 hrs CBSC 



WORKSHOPS (2020-21) 

 

KULWINDER KAUR 

 

Sr. No. Name of the training courses Destination/No.of 

Days 

Organized by 

1 Developing Personal Social 

Qualities (PSQ) for creating a 

safe and healthy social 

environment 

2 hrs KVS 

2 Curriculum and Inclusive 

classrooms 

2 hrs KVS 

3 Health and wellbeing in schools 2 hrs KVS 

4 School Based Assessment 2 hrs CBSE 

5 Pedagogy of Environmental 

studies 

2 hrs CBSE 

6 Pedagogy of Mathematics 2 hrs CBSE 

7 Ten Commandments of Happy 

and Successful Life 

1 hr Full Marks 

8 Teacher parents partnership for 

Interactive and effective Online 

education 

1 hr Full Marks 

9 Competency Building for Pre 

primary Teachers(Multiple 

Intelligence and Phonics) 

1 hr Full Marks 

10 Pedagogy of Science 2 hrs CBSE 

11 Pedagogy of Social Science 2 hrs CBSE 

12 Pedagogy of languages 2 hrs CBSE 

13 Pre-Vocational Education 1 hr CBSE 

14 Covid-19 Scenerio:Addressing 

Challenges in School Education 

2 hrs CBSE 

15 Understanding Rights, Child 

Sexual Abuse and The POCSO 

Act 2012 

2 hrs CBSE 

17 Experimental Learning Course 1 hr 20 min CBSE 

18 Pre-Primary 1 hr OXFORD 

19 Art Integrated Learning 2 hrs AS 



WORKSHOPS (2020-21) 

GURMEET KAUR NEW 

Sr.no. Name of Training Course Duration / 

No . Of 

Days 

Organized 

by 

1 Discussion on early childhood 

education in pre primary teachers 

2 hrs Goyal brothers 

Prakshan 

2 Implementation of art integrated 

learning inEnglish language teaching. 

2 hrs Goyal Brothers 

Prakashan 

3 Stress Management during 

Covid -19 pandemic. 

2 hrs Goyal Brother 

Prakashan 

4 Pedagogy of social studies 2  hr CBSE 

5 Pedagogy of Science. 1 hr CBSE 

6 Pedagogy of Languages. 1 hr CBSE 

7 Pre-vocational  Education 1 hr CBSE 

8 COVID -19 Scenario : 

Addressing challenges in school 

Education. 

1 hr CBSE 

9 Understanding Rights, Child sexual 

Abuse and The POCO Act , 2012. 

1 hr CBSE 

10 �वघालय आधा
रत आकलन 1.30 mins CBSE 

11 Initiatives in school Education. 1 hr CBSE 

12 Experiential learning course. 1.20 mins CBSE 

13 Competency based education 

Module - 1. 

1 hr CBSE 

14 Competency based education 

Module - 2. 

1.30 mins CBSE 

15 Competency based education 

Module - 3 

1 hr CBSE 

16 Competency based education 

Module - 4 

1 hr CBSE 

17 समािजक �वकास का �श�णश� 2 hr ICSE 

18 School leadership : concepts and 

applications 

1 hr CBSE 

19 ������ �� ������ ���� 2 hr CBSE 

20 Curriculum and Inclusive classroom 1.30 mins KVS 

21 As Art integrates learning 2 hr KVS 



22 Pedagogy of mathematics 1 hr CBSE 

23 School Based Assessment 1 hr CBSE 

24 Pedagogy of Environmental studies 1 hr CBSE 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



WORKSHOPS (2020-21) 

HARWINDER KAUR NEW 

Sr.no. Name of Training Course Duration / 

No . Of 

Days 

Organized 

by 

1 Discussion on early childhood 

education in pre primary teachers 

2 hrs Goyal brothers 

Prakshan 

2 Implementation of art integrated 

learning inEnglish language teaching. 

2 hrs Goyal Brothers 

Prakashan 

3 Stress Management during 

Covid -19 pandemic. 

2 hrs Goyal Brother 

Prakashan 

4 Pedagogy of social studies 2  hr CBSE 

5 Pedagogy of Science. 1 hr CBSE 

6 Pedagogy of Languages. 1 hr CBSE 

7 Pre-vocational  Education 1 hr CBSE 

8 COVID -19 Scenario : 

Addressing challenges in school 

Education. 

1 hr CBSE 

9 Understanding Rights, Child sexual 

Abuse and The POCO Act , 2012. 

1 hr CBSE 

10 �वघालय आधा
रत आकलन 1.30 mins CBSE 

11 Initiatives in school Education. 1 hr CBSE 

12 Experiential learning course. 1.20 mins CBSE 

13 Competency based education 

Module - 1. 

1 hr CBSE 

14 Competency based education 

Module - 2. 

1.30 mins CBSE 

15 Competency based education 

Module - 3 

1 hr CBSE 

16 Competency based education 

Module - 4 

1 hr CBSE 

17 समािजक �वकास का �श�णश� 2 hr ICSE 

18 School leadership : concepts and 

applications 

1 hr CBSE 

19 ������ �� ������ ���� 2 hr CBSE 

20 Curriculum and Inclusive classroom 1.30 mins KVS 

21 As Art integrates learning 2 hr KVS 



22 Pedagogy of mathematics 1 hr CBSE 

23 School Based Assessment 1 hr CBSE 

24 Pedagogy of Environmental studies 1 hr CBSE 

 

 

 

 

 

 


